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Bamber Bridge
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Located within walking distance of town
centre
Detached industrial unit
Forecourt and roller shutter access
J29 of M6 motorway less than 1.5 miles
distant

DETACHED INDUSTRIAL UNIT
252 m² ( 2,712 ft² )

www.eckersleyproperty.co.uk



Location

The property is situated at the end of Whalley
Street connecting with School Lane (B6258).
The local area comprises a mixture of
residential and business uses.

The property is well located being within
walking distance of Bamber Bridge town
centre whilst also providing easy access to the
motorway network via J29 of the M6 being
less than 1.5 miles to the south.

Description

The property comprises a single storey brick
built unit with profiled metal sheet roof
including translucent roof lights.

Internally the unit is arranged into 2 units, an
office and loading bay. The premises benefit
from separate office and works WC’s in
addition to kitchen facilities.

The unit offers a concrete floor, fluorescent
lighting and security shuttering to the front
windows. Access is via a commercial roller
shutter door from the forecourt accessed from
Whalley Street.

Accommodation

We have estimated the gross internal floor
areas as follows:

m² ft²

Unit 232 2,497
Office 20 215
Total 252 2,712

Services

We understand mains electricity (3-phase),
gas, water and drainage are available to the
premises.

Rating assessment

The premises have a Rateable Value of
£8,000. Prospective occupiers may therefore
be eligible for small business rate relief.

Interested parties are, however, advised to
make their own enquiries with South Ribble
Borough Council (www.southribble.gov.uk).

Planning

It is understood the premises benefit from an
established use within Class E (g) (iii) of the
Town and Country Planning (Use Classes)
Order 1987 (as amended).

Interested parties should make their own
enquiries of the Planning Department at South
Ribble Borough Council,
(www.southribble.gov.uk).

Tenure

The premises are available by way of a new
lease for a term of years to be agreed.

Rental

£20,500 per annum, exclusive.

Photographs and Plans

All photographs and plans incorporated
herewith are indicative and provided for
identification purposes only and should not
therefore be relied upon.

Energy Performance Certificate

Legal costs

The ingoing Tenant will contribute towards the
Landlords reasonable legal costs incurred in
the preparation of the lease.

VAT

All rentals quoted will be subject to VAT at the
standard rate.

Enquiries

Please contact the sole letting agents:
Eckersley
Telephone: 01772 883388

Contact: Harry Holden / Mark Clarkson

Email: preston@eckersleyproperty.co.uk

Preston office
25A Winckley Square
Preston
PR1 3JJ
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01772 883388
preston@eckersleyproperty.co.uk

Lancaster office
76 Church St
Lancaster
LA1 1ET

T |
E |

01524 60524
lancaster@eckersleyproperty.co.uk

Eckersley for themselves and for the vendors or the lessors of this property whose agents they are give notice that i) The particulars are set out as a general outline only for the guidance of the intended purchaser or lessees and do not constitute any part of an offer or
contract. ii) All descriptions, dimensions, references to condition and necessary permissions for the use and occupation, and other details are given in good faith but without responsibility and intending purchasers or tenants should not rely on them as statements or
representations of fact but must satisfy themselves by inspection or otherwise as to the correctness of them. iii) No person in the employment of Eckersley has any authority to make or give any representation or warranty whatever in relation to this property.


